
[TO BE PUBLISHED IN THE GAZETTE OF INDIA, EXTRAORDINARY, PART 
II, SECTION 3, SUB-SECTION (i)] 

Government of India 
Ministry of Corporate Affairs 

Notification 

New Delhi, the 07September, 2020, 

G.s.R. _ (E). - In exercise of the powers conferred by section 73 read with 

sub-sections (1) and (2) of section 469 of the Companies Act, 2013 (18 of 2013), the 

Central Government in consultation with the Reserve Bank of India, hereby makes 

the following rules further to amend the Companies (Acceptance of Deposits) 

Rules, 2014, namely:- 

1. (1) These rules may be called the Companies (Acceptance of Deposits) 

Amendment Rules, 2020. 

(2) They shall come into force on the date of their publication in the Official 

Gazette. 

2. In the Companies (Acceptance of Deposits) Rules, 2014 (hereinafter referred 

to as the said rules), in rule 2, in sub-rule (1), in clause (c), in sub-clause (xvii), - 

(i) for the words "five years", the words" ten years" shall be substituted; 

(ii) in the Explanation, in clause I, for the letters, figures, brackets and words 

"G.s.R. 180 (E) dated 17th February, 2016 issued by the Department of Industrial 

Policy and Promotion, Ministry of Commerce and Industry", the letters, figures, 



brackets and words "G.s.R. 127 (E), dated the 19th February, 2019 issued by the 

Department for Promotion of Industry and Internal Trade" shall be substituted. 

3. In the said rules, in rule 3, in sub-rule (3), in the second proviso, in clause 

(i), for the words" five years", the words, "ten years" shall be substituted. 

[File No 1/8/2013- CL-V Vol VI] 

~~~ o~ 9 ~"2,0 
(K V Mu~ty) 

Joint Secretary to the Government of India 

Note. - The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, 

Part II, Section 3, Sub-section (i) vide number G.s.R. 256(E), dated the 31st March, 

2014 and were last amended vide notification number G.s.R. 341(E), dated the 30th 

April, 2019. 



3IT«f 'fI '{ Cfl H 
CfI H cfl ~ C! ~ Ji Emit 4 

~ 

if$"~, 07 ~(1RH, 2020 

m.q;r.fat (31).- ~ {i{CfiI{, cf;qa:fr ~, 2013 (2013 q;r 18) cfi'r 
urn 469 cfi'r NURT (1) 31R NUTU (2) ct m~ ~ urn 73 ~ ~ ~lfctCilll 
q;r ~ ~ -gv :H1{ci')llI ~ ~ ct m~ qu11~T ~ cf;qa:fr (-amm cfi'r f~lCflf8) ~ ~ 
~, 2014 ~ 31R t=f~Jlua:r ~ ~ ~CFCrlQffiCi fa'1<m" ~ 6", 31~:- 

1. (1) ~ ~lI<Hl q;r ~ am1 cf;qa:fr (-amm cfi'r f~~tf8) t=f~Jlua:r ~, 2020 

6"1 

2. cf;"qa:fr (-amm cfi'r f~~tf8) ~, 2014 (~ ~ ~ q~:mc=[ 3CF(1 ~ ~ 

"d"flIT 6"), ~ 2~, jq~lI<H (1) ~, (Sfs (dT) ~, ~ (xvii) ~,- 

(i) II~ ~II ~~ ct ~ IICRT ~" ~~ w ~; 
(ii) fqlSt)Cfi{OI ~, <:Sis I ~, "Jfk;._mfJ'lCfi ~ 3tR ~ ~3WT, qlflfivll 31R jC\._lI~JI 

cH~l(>lll ~ ~ m.q;r.fa1.180(31) ~ 17 ~, 2016" 31mT, .3fcH, Q;)1S6Q;1 31R 

~~ ct ~ "jC\._mJI 31R 3iiCi~Cfl clllql{ ~ ~3WT ~ ~ m.q;r.fa1.127(31) 

~ 19 ~, 2019 31m, 3fcn, Q;)1S6Cfi 31R ~~ W ~I 

3. 3CF(1 ~1I<H1 ~, fa'1<m" 3 ~, N-~ (3) ~, C;fclci')llI ~ ~, (Sfs (i) ~, ,,~ ._ ~ 

~" ~~ ~ ~ "CRT ~" ~~ -rn ~I 

R:cqol : <H(>f fa'1<m" m.q;r.fa1. ~ 256(31) <1l"fmr 31 ~, 2014 ~ :Hl«1 ct (101q~ ~ ._ 

3ffiTURUT, 3WT 2, <:Sis 3, ~ (i) ~ ~ fcI:lc! ~ 3-tR 3-ffi1J:r ~ t=f~ITtra1 
~ ~ m.q;r.fa1. 341(31) ~ 30 .mh;r, 2019 ~ ~"d"flIT1 ~ ._ 

***** 


